SALVAGE BID TABULATION

Specification Number: F998940039 Page 1 Date: January 12, 2000

Project Description: For Sale: Approximately 22 Various Fire Department Vehicles REVISED TABULATION 1-13-00 AT 9:26 AM

Bid Deposit: $ NONE Addendum 1 2 3 4 Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER A266 A262 A297 C778 C845 C852 C850 432 445 472 A296 C870
KANKAKEE AUTO PARTS $57.00 $52.00 $57.00 $178.00 $312.00 $312.00 $312.00 $88.00 $178.00 $88.00 $88.00 $312.00
WILKINSREBUILDERS SUPPLY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WILLIAM T.GILL NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GASPAR GONZALEZ NO BID NO BID NOBID $250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID $100.00 NO BID
L & L AUTO PARTS INC. NO BID NO BID $126.00 $426.00 $552.00 $552.00 $552.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $126.00 $615.00
MANAGEMENT & MORE $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $200.00 $300.00 $400.00 $350.00 $100.00 $200.00 $100.00 $50.00 $300.00
AL GUTENSCHWAGER NO BID NO BID NO BID $252.00 $308.00 $406.00 $358.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $506.00
GALICH ELECTRIC NO BID NO BID NOBID $150.00 $300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID $300.00
ERICKSON TRUCK SALES NO BID NO BID NO BID $867.00 $1,137.00 $1,037.00 $937.00 NO BID $867.00 NO BID NO BID $1,337.00
DERBY HILL EQUIPMENT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID $627.00
RICHARDSAUTO SALES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
AUCTION SERVICES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
JOHN DZIEDZIC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $409.00 $255.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ANDYSTRUCK & EQUIPMENT NO BID NO BID NOBID $529.00 NO BID $836.00 $829.00 NO BID $836.00 NO BID NO BID $847.00
WAYNE BUILT & SON NO BID NOBID NO BID $250.00 $450.00 $345.00 $345.00 $245.00 $750.00 $175.00 NO BID $345.00
CLARK MAINTENANCE $50.00 $100.00 $50.00 $200.00 $200.00 $250.00 $200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $100.00 $150.00




SALVAGE BID TABULATION

Specification Number: F998940039 Page 2 Date: January 12, 2000
Project Description: For Sale: Approximately 22 Various Fire Department Vehicles REVISED TABULATION 1-13-00 AT 9:26 AM
Bid Deposit: $ NONE Addendum 1 2 3 4 Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER C849 865 A252 C826 C909 A867 A289 A408 B421 429
KANKAKEE AUTO PARTS $312.00 $312.00 $35.00 $212.00 $312.00 $37.00 $57.00 NB $52.00 $52.00
WILKINSREBUILDERS SUPPLY No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid
WILLIAM T.GILL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GASPAR GONZALEZ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
L & L AUTO PARTS, INC. $552.00 $552.00 No Bid $604.00 $550.00 No Bid $126.00 NoBid NoBid NoBid
MANAGEMENT & MORE $250.00 $300.00 $50.00 $50.00 $500.00 $50.00 $50.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
AL GUTENSCHWAGER $606.00 $408.00 NoBid NoBid $156.00 NoBid NoBid No Bid $101.00 No Bid
GALICH ELECTRIC $250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid
ERICKSON TRUCK SALES $1,157.00 $1,357.00 No Bid $867.00 $2,137.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
DERBY HILL EQUIPMENT $627.00 $627.00 NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
RICHARDSAUTO SALES NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid
AUCTION SERVICES No Bid $412.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JOHN DZIEDZIC No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ANDYSTRUCK & EQUIPMENT $836.00 $847.00 No Bid $739.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid
WAYNE BUILT & SON $245.00 $345.00 No Bid $175.00 $455.00 $455.00 $455.00 No Bid $55.00 $25.00
CLARK MAINTENANCE $200.00 No Bid $150.00 No Bid $100.00 No Bid $100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of Chicago, Richard M. Daley, Mayor

Department of Purchases, Contracts & Supplies, Alexander Grzyb, Acting-Purchasing Agent




