

SALVAGE BID TABULATION

2nd Revised 11-3-00 11:30 AM

Specification Number: F0998940015

Date: November 2, 2000



Project Description: SALE - 26 USED VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 1	Georges	AL Witvoet	J. Pittman	Michael	Jimmy	J.B. Szarek	AL Gutens.	Edca Auto	Richards	Ideal Auto	Gaspar	Rick H.
1) FDA272	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$256.00	\$101.00	\$1,069.00	X	X
2) FDA274	X	X	X	X	\$250.00	X	X	\$256.00	\$366.00	\$1,069.00	X	X
3) FDA275	X	X	\$201.00	\$601.00	\$325.00	\$887.99	X	\$376.00	\$401.00	\$1,069.00	X	X
4) FDA276	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$356.00	\$361.00	\$1,069.00	X	\$289.00
5) FDA277	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$351.00	\$110.00	\$1,069.00	X	\$389.00
6) FDA279	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$231.00	\$35.00	\$869.00	X	X
7) FDA284	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$106.00	\$61.00	\$869.00	X	\$469.00
8) FDA285	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$26.00	\$106.00	\$469.00	X	X
9) FDA290	X	X	X	\$501.00	\$250.00	X	X	\$51.00	\$126.00	\$469.00	X	X
10) FDA294	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$151.00	\$115.00	\$469.00	X	X
11) FDA299	X	X	X	\$501.00	X	X	X	\$76.00	\$110.00	\$469.00	X	X
12) FDA382	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$356.00	\$215.00	X	X	X
13) EN0103	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$35.00	X	X	X
14) FM1089	X	X	X	X	\$450.00	X	X	\$411.00	\$426.00	\$1,069.00	X	X
15) FM2054	\$875.00	\$2,150.89	\$251.00	X	X	X	\$2,526.27	\$1,701.00	\$1,414.00	\$2,169.00	\$2,176.75	X
16) GS1054	X	X	X	X	X	\$537.50	X	\$576.00	\$115.00	\$669.00	X	X
17) GS1234	\$425.00	X	X	\$201.00	\$150.00	\$483.29	\$511.14	\$356.00	\$531.00	\$469.00	X	X
18) GS3901	\$425.00	\$450.89	X	X	\$325.00	\$219.57	\$611.14	\$356.00	\$210.00	\$1,669.00	X	X
19) PV0085	X	X	X	\$601.00	X	\$816.99	X	\$106.00	\$155.00	\$869.00	X	X
20) FDC827	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X
21) NO EQUIP#	\$325.00	\$975.50	X	\$101.00	\$200.00	X	X	\$156.00	\$35.00	X	X	X
22) FDC729	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$110.00	X	X	X

SALVAGE BID TABULATION

2nd Revised 11-3-00 11:30 AM

Specification Number: F0998940015

Date: November 2, 2000



Project Description: SALE - 26 USED VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 3	Tom McIn.	A-1 Services	John Bowen	Park Cons	Cozzi Iron	Auto Whole.	Arthur Kidd	T & B	WM. Hoesk.	Vintage	A-1 Salvage	Derby Hill
1) FDA272	\$479.50	\$105.00	REJECTED	\$275.55	\$30.00	NO BID	REJECTED	X	NO BID	NO BID	X	NO BID
2) FDA274	X	\$105.00		\$175.55	\$30.00			X			X	
3) FDA275	\$559.00	\$325.10		\$165.55	\$30.00			\$501.52			X	
4) FDA276	X	\$105.00		\$285.55	\$30.00			\$251.45			X	
5) FDA277	X	\$55.00		\$155.55	\$30.00			X			\$589.89	
6) FDA279	X	\$50.10		\$301.55	\$30.00			\$155.60			X	
7) FDA284	X	\$50.10		X	\$30.00			\$425.55			X	
8) FDA285	X	\$50.10		X	\$30.00			\$175.54			X	
9) FDA290	X	\$50.10		X	\$30.00			\$151.20			X	
10) FDA294	X	\$50.10		X	\$30.00			\$156.80			X	
11) FDA299	X	\$50.10		X	\$30.00			\$225.53			X	
12) FDA382	X	\$707.10		X	\$30.00			\$125.00			X	
13) EN0103	X	X		X	\$30.00			X			X	
14) FM1089	X	\$223.10		X	\$30.00			\$510.96			X	
15) FM2054	X	X		\$1,555.55	\$30.00			\$1,251.55			X	
16) GS1054	X	\$277.10		X	\$30.00			X			X	
17) GS1234	X	\$402.55		X	\$30.00			\$155.75			X	
18) 3901	X	\$301.10		X	\$30.00			\$455.60			X	
19) PV0085	X	X		X	\$30.00			\$375.52			X	
20) FDC827	X	X		X	\$30.00			X			X	
21) NO EQUIP#	X	X		X	\$30.00			\$460.75			X	
22) FDC729	X	X		X	\$30.00			X			X	

