
SALVAGE  BID  TABULATION
Specification Number:  F0998940013                                                                                             Revised 10-13-00 at 12:48 PM                           Date: October 13, 2000

Project Description:  Sale 25 Used Vehicles & Equipment

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                                           Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 1 Andy’s Cozzi Wn. Sons T & B Georges Richards Gaspar AL Gutens. Edca Auto Matt Dz. Erickson Carlos

1)   E202 $589.00 $200.00 X X X NO BID NO BID X X X $457.00 X

2)   E225 $269.00 $125.00 X X X X X X $57.00 X

3)   D395 $969.00 $225.00 X X X X X X $427.00 X

4)   D466 $249.00 $125.00 X X X X X X $37.00 X

5)   D463 $249.00 $100.00 X X X X X X $57.00 X

6)   D440 $1,269.00 $200.00 X X X X X X $1,657.00 X

7)   E228 $969.00 $200.00 X X X X X X $657.00 X

8)   E232 $899.00 $225.00 X X X X X X $827.00 X

9)   D475 $589.00 $200.00 X X X X X X $417.00 X

10) E219 $1,169.00 $250.00 X X X X X X $437.00 X

11) E205 $1,169.00 $150.00 X X X X X X $517.00 X

12) FM1042 X $35.00 X $125.51 X X $126.00 $11.00 X $300.00

13) GS0153 X $30.00 X $126.56 $180.00 X $305.00 X X $600.00

14) 12605 X $10.00 X X X X X $11.00 X X

15) INSPG9 X $35.00 X $51.56 X X X X X X

16) 13263 X $15.00 X X X X X $26.00 X X

17) C814 $689.00 $40.00 X X X $1,160.10 X $81.00 $657.00 $500.00

18) C825 $649.00 $45.00 X X X $1,061.10 X $81.00 $657.00 $500.00

19) E204 $300.00 X X X X X X $1,107.00 X

20) FDA326 $1,269.00 $25.00 X X X X X $11.00 X $600.00

21) NO# X $20.00 X X X X X $54.00 $27.00 X

22) FDG322 $129.00 $20.00 X X X X X $51.00 $27.00 X



SALVAGE  BID  TABULATION
Specification Number:  F0998940013                                                                                             Revised 10-13-00 at 12:48 PM                           Date: October 13, 2000

Project Description:  Sale 25 Used Vehicles & Equipment

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                                           Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 2 Andy’s Cozzi Wn. Sons T & B Georges Richards Gaspar AL Gutens. Edca Auto Matt Dz. Erickson Carlos

23) FDJ300 $129.00 $15.00 $1,007.00 X X NO BID NO BID $58.58 X $126.00 $167.00 X

24) FDJ302 $369.00 $15.00 $777.00 X X $68.68 X $126.00 $37.00 X

25) 3802 $369.00 $30.00 X $351.55 X $319.04 $123.00 $127.00 X $600.00



SALVAGE  BID  TABULATION
Specification Number:  F0998940013                                                                                             Revised 10-13-00 at 12:48 PM                           Date: October 13, 2000

Project Description:  Sale 25 Used Vehicles & Equipment

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                                           Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 3 Derby Hill

1)   E202 NO BID

2)   E225

3)   D395

4)   D466

5)   D463

6)   D440

7)   E228

8)   E232

9)   D475

10) E219

11) E205

12) FM1042

13) GS0153

14) 12605

15) INSPG9

16) 13263

17) C814

18) C825

19) E204

20) FDA326

21) NO#

22) FDG322



SALVAGE  BID  TABULATION
Specification Number:  F0998940013                                                                                             Revised 10-13-00 at 12:48 PM                           Date: October 13, 2000

Project Description:  Sale 25 Used Vehicles & Equipment

Bid Deposit: $ NONE                                                                                   Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                                           Contract Administrator:   J. Picl

Name of Bidder Pg. 2 Derby Hill

23) FDJ300 NO BID

24) FDJ302

25) 3802

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of Chicago   Department of Purchases, Contracts & Supplies
Richard M. Daley, Mayor David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer 


