

SALVAGE TABULATION

Specification Number: F1998940001

Date: February 9, 2001



Project Description: SALE - 22 USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J. Piel

Name of Bidder Pg. 1	AL Gutensch.	John Wright	Derby Hill	Adelman's	DC Sales	Edca Auto	First Snow	Cozzi Iron	AL Witvoet	Carlos A.	Yvette S.	T & B
1) RV0121	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$20.00	X	X	X	X
2) S3802	\$184.07	X	X	X	\$403.00	\$76.00	\$313.52	\$30.00	\$199.09	X	X	X
3) 11610	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$40.00	X	X	X	X
4) A273	X	X	X	X	X	\$176.00	X	\$30.00	X	X	X	X
5) S3826	X	X	X	X	\$403.00	\$105.00	\$471.03	\$30.00	\$225.08	X	X	X
6) A326	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$25.00	\$110.07	X	X	X
7) 12026	X	\$401.00	\$567.00	\$1,352.00	X	X	X	\$70.00	\$575.00	X	X	X
8) 12028	X	\$401.00	\$1,267.00	\$1,572.00	X	X	X	\$70.00	\$959.00	X	X	X
9) 12032	X	\$401.00	\$367.00	\$1,252.00	X	X	X	\$40.00	\$677.00	X	X	X
10) 12034	X	\$401.00	\$1,567.00	\$1,672.00	X	X	X	\$70.00	\$985.00	X	X	X
11) 12036	X	\$401.00	\$1,467.00	\$1,372.00	X	X	X	\$70.00	\$995.00	X	X	X
12) 12088	X	\$301.00	X	X	X	X	X	\$40.00	\$150.00	X	X	X
13) DT1523	X	X	X	\$1,552.00	X	X	\$333.33	\$200.00	\$1,850.56	X	X	X
14) C848	\$78.04	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$35.00	\$750.00	\$195.00	X	\$651.30
15) C810	\$256.07	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$35.00	\$675.00	\$195.00	X	\$455.35
16) GS0153	X	X	X	X	\$401.00	\$805.00	X	\$30.00	X	X	X	X
17) FM1042	X	X	X	X	X	\$76.00	X	\$30.00	X	\$229.00	X	\$115.45
18) S3859	\$159.09	X	X	X	\$577.00	\$255.00	\$297.18	\$32.00	\$150.29	X	X	X
19) S3833	\$209.09	X	X	X	\$803.00	\$255.00	\$441.99	\$32.00	\$295.89	\$175.00	\$400.00	X
20) S3555	\$157.04	X	X	X	X	\$76.00	X	\$30.00	X	X	X	X
21) S3552	\$109.09	X	X	X	X	\$255.00	X	\$30.00	X	X	X	X
22) S3543	\$255.06	X	X	X	X	\$251.00	X	\$30.00	X	X	X	X

SALVAGE TABULATION

Specification Number: F1998940001

Date: February 9, 2001



Project Description: SALE - 22 USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J. Piel

Name of Bidder	Pg. 2	Andy's Truck	Erickson	Northwest F.	Saeed Auto	Gaspar G.	Vintage Veh.	Auto Whole.	Edward Kus				
1) RV0121		X	X	X	X	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
2) S3802		X	\$217.00	X	X	X	X	X	X				
3) 11610		\$39.00	\$87.00	X	X	X	X	X	X				
4) A273		X	X	X	\$327.00	X	X	X	X				
5) S3826		X	\$227.00	X	X	X	X	X	X				
6) A326		X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X				
7) 12026		\$298.00	\$1,357.00	X	X	X	X	X	X				
8) 12028		\$772.00	\$2,807.00	X	X	X	X	X	X				
9) 12032		\$198.00	\$1,137.00	X	X	X	X	X	X				
10) 12034		\$772.00	\$4,157.00	X	X	X	X	X	X				
11) 12036		\$772.00	\$3,357.00	X	X	X	X	X	X				
12) 12088		\$29.00	\$357.00	X	X	X	X	X	X				
13) DT1523		\$1,869.00	\$2,307.00	\$1,555.55	X	X	X	X	X				
14) C848		\$769.00	\$857.00	X	X	X	X	X	X				
15) C810		\$678.00	\$627.00	X	X	X	X	X	X				
16) GS0153		X	X	X	\$427.00	X	X	X	X				
17) FM1042		X	X	X	\$36.00	X	X	X	X				
18) S3859		X	\$127.00	X	\$51.00	X	X	X	X				
19) S3833		X	\$257.00	X	\$427.00	X	X	X	X				
20) S3555		X	X	X	\$203.00	X	X	X	X				
21) S3552		X	X	X	\$181.00	X	X	X	X				
22) S3543		X	X	X	\$77.00	X	X	X	X				

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.

City of Chicago
Richard M. Daley, Mayor

Department of Procurement Services
David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer