

SALVAGE TABULATION



Specification Number: F3998940003

Date: March 26, 2003

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER	PG. 1	Junk Services	Al Witvoet	Derby Hill Equipment	Auto Wholesalers	McCoy Auto Parts	LV Trucking, Inc.	AAA Dollar Disposal Inc.	Artisan Terrazzo Inc.	James DeNorio	Lubbers & Son	Richards Auto Sales	Ralph Hare Tire Co.
PK1089		X	X	X	NO BID	\$100.00	NO BID	X	X	X	X	NO BID	X
PK1022		\$169.00	X	X		\$25.00		X	\$75.00	X	X		X
PK1359		X	X	X		\$25.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK1034		X	X	X		\$20.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK3304		X	X	X		\$20.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK1085		\$145.00	X	X		\$20.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK1137		X	X	X		X		X	X	X	X		X
PK1119		X	X	X		\$20.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK1096		\$148.00	X	X		\$50.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK3344		X	X	X		\$25.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK1630		\$626.00	\$1,275.25	\$1,627.00		\$25.00		\$2,513.00	X	X	X		X
PK3805		X	\$175.00	X		\$75.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK1003		X	X	X		X		X	X	X	X		X
PK1147		X	X	X		\$50.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK1256		\$245.00	\$275.75	X		\$100.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK3503		X	X	X		X		X	X	X	X		X
PK3331		X	X	X		\$75.00		X	X	X	X		X

SALVAGE TABULATION



Specification Number: F3998940003

Date: March 26, 2003

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER	PG. 2	Junk Services	Al Witvoet	Derby Hill Equipment	Auto Wholesalers	McCoy Auto Parts	LV Trucking, Inc.	AAA Dollar Disposal Inc.	Artisan Terrazzo Inc.	James DeNorio	Lubbers & Son	Richards Auto Sales	Ralph Hare Tire Co.
PK3807		X	\$100.00	X		\$50.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK1005		\$101.00	X	X	NO BID	X	NO BID	X	X	X	X	NO BID	X
PK3812		\$128.00	\$100.00	X		\$100.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK1012		X	X	X		\$50.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK3808		X	\$175.00	X		\$75.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK1187		X	X	X		\$25.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK1154		X	X	X		X		X	X	X	X		X
PK0105		\$178.00	\$100.00	\$267.00		X		X	X	X	X		X
PK3311		X	X	X		\$50.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK3455		\$228.00	\$525.25	X		X		X	X	X	X		X
PK3112		\$458.00	\$1,875.50	\$1,267.00		\$50.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK3802		X	\$75.00	X		\$55.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK1675		\$365.00	\$1,525.50	X		\$75.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK1601		\$498.00	\$1,375.35	X		X		X	X	X	X		X
PK1035		X	X	X		\$25.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK3312		X	X	X		\$25.00		X	\$75.00	X	X		X
PK3332		X	X	X		\$100.00		X	X	X	X		X

SALVAGE TABULATION



Specification Number: F3998940003

Date: March 26, 2003

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER	Junk Services	Al Witvoet	Derby Hill Equipment	Auto Wholesalers	McCoy Auto Parts	LV Trucking, Inc.	AAA Dollar Disposal Inc.	Artisan Terrazzo Inc.	James DeNorio	Lubbers & Son	Richards Auto Sales	Ralph Hare Tire Co.
CPD592	\$525.00	\$1,150.00	X	NO BID	X	NO BID	X	X	X	X	NO BID	X
PK4419	\$998.00	\$3,675.00	\$4,667.00		\$50.00		X	\$75.00	\$2,501.99	\$4,760.00		\$3,100.00
PK1607	\$101.00	\$375.25	X		X		X	X	X	X		X
PK1002	X	X	X		\$75.00		X	X	X	X		X
PK1605	\$425.00	\$410.25	X		X		X	X	X	X		X
PK1649	\$188.00	\$1,125.25	X		X		X	X	X	X		X
PK1189	\$426.00	\$350.25	\$367.00		\$75.00		X	X	X	X		X

PG. 3

SALVAGE TABULATION



Specification Number: F3998940003

Date: March 26, 2003

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER	PG. 4	A-1 Services	Erickson Trucks-N-Parts	North Shore Recycling Inc.	Mark Downs	A&M Auto	Cozzi Iron & Metal Inc.	American Waste					
PK1089		x	X	\$73.50	X	X	X	X					
PK1022		\$55.00	X	\$115.00	X	X	\$45.00	X					
PK1359		x	X	\$68.50	X	X	\$45.00	X					
PK1034		x	X	\$68.50	X	X	\$45.00	X					
PK3304		x	X	\$105.00	X	X	\$50.00	X					
PK1085		\$127.00	\$337.11	\$75.00	X	\$105.05	\$45.00	X					
PK1137		x	X	\$76.00	X	X	\$45.00	X					
PK1119		x	\$227.11	\$75.00	X	\$205.05	\$50.00	\$300.00					
PK1096		\$117.00	X	\$73.00	X	\$205.55	\$50.00	X					
PK3344		x	X	\$70.00	X	X	\$50.00	X					
PK1630		\$115.00	\$2,677.11	\$105.00	X	\$105.55	X	X					
PK3805		x	\$127.11	\$73.00	X	\$250.05	\$45.00	X					
PK1003		x	X	\$68.00	X	X	\$45.00	X					
PK1147		x	X	\$70.00	X	X	\$50.00	X					
PK1256		\$855.00	\$777.11	\$112.00	\$326.00	\$850.55	\$60.00	\$1,000.00					
PK3503		x	X	\$68.00	X	\$105.55	\$55.00	X					
PK3331		x	X	\$110.00	X	X	\$50.00	X					
PK3807		x	\$127.11	\$115.00	X	\$151.05	\$45.00	X					

SALVAGE TABULATION



Specification Number: F3998940003

Date: March 26, 2003

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER	PG. 5	A-1 Services	Erickson Trucks-N-Parts	North Shore Recycling Inc.	Mark Downs	A&M Auto	Cozzi Iron & Metal Inc.	American Waste				
PK1005		x	X	\$105.00	X	X	\$55.00	X				
PK3812		\$127.00	\$657.11	\$110.00	X	\$655.55	\$50.00	X				
PK1012		x	X	\$105.00	X	X	\$55.00	X				
PK3808		x	X	\$105.00	X	\$100.00	\$45.00	X				
PK1187		\$117.00	X	\$110.00	X	X	\$55.00	X				
PK1154		x	X	\$73.00	X	X	\$50.00	X				
PK0105		x	\$127.11	\$110.00	X	X	\$30.00	X				
PK3311		x	X	\$110.00	X	X	X	X				
PK3455		x	\$157.11	\$100.00	X	X	X	X				
PK3112		x	\$3,117.11	\$75.00	X	\$250.00	\$200.00	X				
PK3802		x	\$127.11	\$70.00	X	\$190.50	\$45.00	X				
PK1675		\$355.00	\$2,307.11	\$75.00	X	\$805.00	\$200.00	\$570.00				
PK1601		x	\$917.11	\$105.00	X	\$855.05	\$250.00	X				
PK1035		x	X	\$100.00	X	X	\$45.00	X				
PK3312		x	X	\$100.00	X	X	\$50.00	X				
PK3332		x	X	\$102.00	X	X	\$50.00	X				
CPD592		x	\$837.11	\$100.00	X	X	X	X				

SALVAGE TABULATION



Specification Number: F3998940003

Date: March 26, 2003

Project Description: USED VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit: \$ NONE

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER	PG. 6	A-1 Services	Erickson Trucks-N-Parts	North Shore Recycling Inc.	Mark Downs	A&M Auto	Cozzi Iron & Metal Inc.	American Waste				
PK4419		\$101.00	\$1,807.11	\$75.00	X	\$2,155.00	\$150.00	\$1,400.00				
PK1607		\$207.00	\$357.11	\$95.00	X	\$255.05	\$200.00	X				
PK1002		x	X	\$95.00	X	X	\$40.00	X				
PK1605		x	\$637.11	\$90.00	X	\$1,050.55	\$250.00	\$600.00				
PK1649		\$255.00	\$657.11	\$90.00	X	\$250.00	\$200.00	X				
PK1189		\$427.00	\$157.11	\$75.00	X	\$155.55	\$50.00	X				

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.

City of Chicago
Richard M. Daley, Mayor

Department of Procurement Services
David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer