

SALVAGE TABULATION

Specification Number: F3998940019

Date: October 1, 2003



Project Description: FOR SALE, USED EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit:

Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: J.

Piel

NAME OF BIDDER	RICHARD'S AUTO SALES	AUTO WHOLESALEERS	VINTAGE VEHICLES & PARTS, INC.	DERBY HILL EQUIPMENT	TRUCKS & PARTS OF OHIO	ROETERS FARM EQ.,INC.	MINAS KLIVAS	ADELMAN'S TRUCK PARTS CORP.	ERCISON TRUCKS-N- PARTS	ILLIANA TRUCK PARTS, INC.	WM. HOEKSTRA & SONS, INC.	A & M AUTO	ANDY'S TRUCK Equipment Co.
S11310	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,169.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,289.00	\$667.11	\$909.03	\$937.00	\$300.00	\$1,129.00
S11319	X	X	X	X	\$369.00	X	X	X	\$757.11	\$759.03	\$857.00	X	\$639.00
S11320	X	X	X	X	\$1,269.00	X	X	\$1,289.00	\$811.11	\$759.03	\$790.00	X	\$889.00
S11321	X	X	X	X	\$1,069.00	X	X	\$921.00	\$657.11	\$759.03	\$847.00	\$200.00	\$789.00
S11323	X	X	X	X	\$369.00	X	X	\$921.00	\$411.11	\$759.03	\$851.00	\$150.00	\$796.00
S11331	X	X	X	X	\$469.00	X	X	\$921.00	\$627.11	\$759.03	\$890.00	X	\$729.00
S11333	X	X	X	X	\$769.00	X	X	\$888.00	\$627.11	\$759.03	\$751.00	\$200.00	\$769.00
S11334	X	X	X	X	\$669.00	X	X	\$938.00	\$611.11	\$759.03	\$912.00	\$259.00	\$769.00
S11335	X	X	X	X	\$769.00	X	X	\$1,085.00	\$557.11	\$759.03	\$657.00	\$200.00	\$729.00
S11341	X	X	X	X	\$769.00	X	X	\$988.00	\$557.11	\$759.03	\$670.00	\$150.00	\$729.00
S11342	X	X	X	X	\$769.00	X	X	\$1,141.00	\$777.11	\$759.03	\$777.00	X	\$729.00
S11353	X	X	X	X	\$569.00	X	X	\$941.00	\$627.11	\$759.03	\$717.00	\$350.00	\$729.00
S11361	X	X	X	X	\$1,369.00	X	X	\$1,289.00	\$1,111.11	\$909.03	\$1,190.00	\$259.00	\$1,127.00
S11370	X	X	X	X	\$1,169.00	X	X	\$1,289.00	\$927.11	\$909.03	\$902.00	\$251.00	\$1,089.00
S11371	X	X	X	X	\$669.00	X	X	\$938.00	\$627.11	\$759.03	\$707.00	\$200.00	\$769.00
S11378	X	X	X	X	\$1,169.00	X	X	\$1,351.00	\$857.11	\$909.03	\$917.00	\$469.00	\$1,069.00

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.

City of Chicago
Richard M. Daley, Mayor

Department of Procurement Services
David E. Malone, Chief Procurement Officer