Specification Number: 1709 RFQ#191

BID TABULATION

Date October 6, 2003

Project Description :PARTS AND SERVICES FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Addendum _1 2 3 4

*Note: Blank cell represents no bid for that specific

Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER

PORTABLE
TOOL &
SALES

PATTEN
INDUSTRIES,
INC.

POWER
EQUIPMENT
LEASING CO.

JIMMY DIESEL

RECYCLING
SYSTEMS &
EQUIPMENT

McCANN
INDUSTRIES,
INC.

DYNATEST
CONSULTING,
INC.

H.CI.
TRANSPORTA
TION TECH

MID-AMERICA
TRUCK
EQUIPMENT
Co.

A-3HEIL DUMP BODIES

$90,000.00

$82,000.00

A-7KOHLER GENERATORS
AND ENGINES

B-3HEIL REFUSE BODIES.

B-6 PITMAN AERIAL
BUCKETS

$148,000.00

C-1DYNATEST-K.J. LAW
AIRPORT RUNWAY FRICTION

$147,181.13

C-2CUSHMAN
ELECTRIC/GASCARTS

$349,080.00

C-3HENDERSON MFG. DUMP
BODIES & SPREADERS

$161,200.00

C-5TORNADO SIDEWALK
VACUUMS

C-8KIMCO CONVEYORS &
EQUIPMENT

$228,000.00

D-2 DAN-LINE FARM
MACHINERY

D-4 PEABODY-MYERS SEWER
CLEANING EQUIPMENT

D-8 WORKHORSE STEP VANS

E-1APT JACK HAMMERS

E-3HORMAN SPREADERS

E-4 PERKINS CART DUMPERS
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Specification Number: 1709 RFQ#191

NAME OF BIDDER

BID TABULATION

Project Description :PARTS AND SERVICES FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT
*Note: Blank cell represents no bid for that ifi
Addendum _ 1 2 3 4

Date October 6, 2003

Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

PORTABLE
TOOL &
SALES

PATTEN
INDUSTRIES,
INC.

POWER
EQUIPMENT
LEASING CO.

JIMMY DIESEL

RECYCLING
SYSTEMS &
EQUIPMENT

McCANN
INDUSTRIES,
INC.

DYNATEST
CONSULTING,
INC.

H.CI.
TRANSPORTA
TION TECH

MID-AMERICA
TRUCK
EQUIPMENT
Co.

E-5TYMCO AIR VACUUM
SWEEPERS

$82,000.00

E-6 ROTO -ZOOM AERIAL
EQUIPMENTS

E-7POWERLITE
GENERATORS

F-1AMERICAN LINCOLN
FLOOR SWEEPERS

F-3INSLEY EXCAVATORS

$100,770.00

F-8 BLUE BIRD BUSES

G-1AQUATECH
CLEANING EQUIPMENT

$148,000.00

G-2DICKEY-JOHN
AUTOMATED SALT
CONTROLS

$100,770.00

$90,000.00

G-4 PROGRESS TANK
BODIES

$90,000.00

G-7ATLAS-COPCO AIR
COMPRESSORS

$183,540.00

$174,000.00

G-8 SEAGRAVE FIRE TRUCKS
AND EQUIPMENT

$336,000.00

H-2DINGSMAGNETIC
SWEEPERS

H-4 REX CONSTRUCTION
MACHINERY

$100,770.00

$87,500.00

H-6 TELEVATOR AERIAL
EQUIPMENT
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Specification Number:1709 RFQ#191

BID TABULATION

Date: October 6, 2003

Project Description :PARTS AND SERVICES FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

NAME OF BIDDER

*Note: Blank cell represents no bid for that specific
Addendum 1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

PORTABLE
TOOL &
SALES

PATTEN
INDUSTRIES,
INC.

POWER
EQUIPMENT
LEASING CO.

JIMMY DIESEL

RECYCLING
SYSTEMS &
EQUIPMENT

McCANN
INDUSTRIES,
INC.

DYNATEST
CONSULTING,
INC.

H.CI.
TRANSPORTA
TION TECH

MID-AMERICA
TRUCK
EQUIPMENT
Co.

H-7 AMERICAN LAFRANCE
FIRE
APPARATUS

$336,000.00

H-8 EMERGENCY ONE FIRE
TRUCKSAND EQUIPMENT

$338,000.00

I-1ATHEY-MOBIL STREET
SWEEPERS

1-2DO-ALL CONSTRUCTION
EQUIPMENT

$100,770.00

I-4 REX WORKS GRINDING
MACHINES

$100,770.00

$87,500.00

1-8 LUVERNE FIRE TRUCKS
AND EQUIPMENT

$100,770.00

$269,000.00

$256,000.00

J-1 AUSTIN-WESTERN SHOP
CRANES

$100,770.00

J-3JOHN DEERE
TRACTORS/INDUSTRIES
ENGINES

$100,770.00

J-5WANCO LIGHT WAGONS

J-6 TIME-VERSALIFT AERIAL
TOWERS

$264,900.00

$214,000.00

J-8 SAULSBURY FIRE TRUCKS
AND EQUIPMENT

$258,000.00

K-1AUTO-CRANE TRUCK
MOUNTED CRANES

$32,000.00
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Specification Number:1709 RFQ#191

BID TABULATION

Date October 6, 2003

Project Description :PARTS AND SERVICES FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

NAME OF BIDDER

*Note: Blank cell represents no bid for that specific
Addendum _1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

PORTABLE
TOOL &
SALES

PATTEN
INDUSTRIES,
INC.

POWER
EQUIPMENT
LEASING CO.

JIMMY DIESEL

RECYCLING
SYSTEMS &
EQUIPMENT

McCANN
INDUSTRIES,
INC.

DYNATEST
CONSULTING,
INC.

H.CI.
TRANSPORTA
TION TECH

MID-AMERICA
TRUCK
EQUIPMENT
Co.

K-2DYNAHOE
LOADERSEXCAVATORS

$100,770.00

K-3JOHNSTON STREET
SWEEPERS

$183,450.00

K-8 BOMONK AIRPORT
RUNWAY FRICTION TESTERS

L-3KAMATSU-DRESSER
FRONT END LOADERS

$100,770.00

L-5WENGER TRAILERS

L-7 ENERGY ABSORPTION
SYSTEM

M-1BINKSPAINT
EQUIPMENT

M-4 SAAB FRICTION
TESTERS

M-7 GARDNER-DENVER AIR
COMPRESSORS

N-6 WIL-LIFT AERIAL
BUCKETS

O-1BOBCAT SKID STEER
LOADERS

$150,432.00

O-2ETNYRE ASPHALT
PAVERS

O-5ALLISCHALMERS
FORKLIFTS

$100,770.00

O-6 WOLLARD
STAIRWAYSLIFTS

O-7INGERSOLL-RAND AIR
COMPRESSORS

$158,709.00
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Specification Number: 1709 RFQ#191

BID TABULATION

Date October 6, 2003

Project Description :PARTS AND SERVICES FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

*Note: Blank cell represents no bid for that specific

Addendum _1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER

PORTABLE
TOOL &
SALES

PATTEN
INDUSTRIES,
INC.

POWER
EQUIPMENT
LEASING CO.

JIMMY DIESEL

RECYCLING
SYSTEMS &
EQUIPMENT

McCANN
INDUSTRIES,
INC.

DYNATEST
CONSULTING,
INC.

H.CI.
TRANSPORTA
TION TECH

MID-AMERICA
TRUCK
EQUIPMENT
Co.

P-6 YALE FORKLIFTS

$100,770.00

P-7 MCNEILUSBODIES

Q-1BOMBARDIER
TRACK MACHINES

Q-4 SPEEDFLO PAINT
STRIPPERS

Q-5BARKO
CLAM/BOOMS

Q-6 ALADDIN
PRESSURE WASHERS

Q-7MCNEILUSREFUSE
PACKERS

R-1BRODERSON
SHOP CRANES

$117,324.00

R-5CLARK FORK LIFTS

$117,324.00

R-7MEDIC MASTER
AMBULANCES

S 1BROWN ASPHALT
PAVERS

S-4STANLEY
PORTABLE HYDRAULIC
EQUIPMENT

T-3MAD VAC RIDING
VACUUMS

U-6 EXCEL PRESSURE
WASHERS
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Specification Number: 1709 RFQ#191

NAME OF BIDDER

*Note: Blank cell represents no bid for that
Addendum _1 2 3 4

BID TABULATION

Project Description :PARTS AND SERVICES FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT

Date October 6, 2003

Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

PORTABLE
TOOL &
SALES

PATTEN
INDUSTRIES,
INC.

POWER
EQUIPMENT
LEASING CO.

JIMMY DIESEL

RECYCLING
SYSTEMS &
EQUIPMENT

McCANN
INDUSTRIES,
INC.

DYNATEST
CONSULTING,
INC.

H.CI.
TRANSPORTA
TION TECH

MID-AMERICA
TRUCK
EQUIPMENT
Co.

V-2GALION ROAD
MACHINERY

$172,770.00

V-6 HOTSY PRESSURE
WASHERS

$166,986.00

V-7 POWER BOSS SWEEPERS
& SCRUBBERS

W-4 SWEEPER BRUSH STREET
SWEEPERS

$100,770.00

W-5HI-RANGER
AERIAL TOWERS

W-6 HYDRO-TECH PRESSURE
WASHERS

X-3MONROE DUMP
BODIES

$148,000.00

X-4 SWENSON
SPREADERS

X-5HYSTER FORK
LIFTS

$133,878.00

X-6 INDUSTRIAL AIR
AIR COMPRESSORS

Y-1CHAUSSE
MANUFACTURING
TOOL HEATERS

Y-2NORTH AMERICAN
OVERHEAD CRANES

Y-3MU-RUNWAY
FRICTION TESTERS

Y-5JLG AERIAL
BUCKETS

$100,770.00
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Specification Number: 1709 RFQ#191

BID TABULATION

Date October 6, 2003

Project Description :PARTS AND SERVICES FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT
*Note: Blank cell represents no bid for that ifi

Addendum _1 2 3 4

Contract Administrator: A. Georgian

NAME OF BIDDER PORTABLE PATTEN POWER JIMMY DIESEL RECYCLING McCANN DYNATEST H.CI. MID-AMERICA
TOOL & INDUSTRIES, EQUIPMENT SYSTEMS & INDUSTRIES, CONSULTING, TRANSPORTA TRUCK
SALES INC. LEASING CO. EQUIPMENT INC. INC. TION TECH EQUIPMENT
Co.
Z-3MULLER CEMENT
MIXERS
Z-ATENNANT SWEEPERS & $214,155.00
SCRUBBERS
Z-5JENNY STEAM
CLEANERS
Z-8NON-OEM PARTS $130,000.00 $125,000.00 $50,000.00 $100,000.00 $80,000.00

AND ACCESSORIES
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BID TABULATION

Specification Number:1709 RFQ#191 Date October 6, 2003

Project Description :PARTS AND SERVICES FOR HEAVY MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT
*Note: Blank cell represents no bid for that specific

Addendum 1 2 3 4 Contract Administrator: A. Georgian
NAME OF BIDDER PORTABLE PATTEN POWER JIMMY DIESEL RECYCLING McCANN DYNATEST H.C.. MID-AMERICA
TOOL & INDUSTRIES, EQUIPMENT SYSTEMS & INDUSTRIES, CONSULTING, TRANSPORTA TRUCK
SALES INC. LEASING CO. EQUIPMENT INC. INC. TION TECH EQUIPMENT

Co.

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.

City of Chicago Departm

ent of
Procure
ment
Services
David E.
Malone
Chief
Procure
ment
Officer

Richard M. Daley, Mayor
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